Summer HELP Program

email: "jrausch@wspa.net jrausch@wspa.net” Tuesday, April 3, 2018 at 2:23:45 PM Pacific Daylight Time
To: email: "julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu”

Hi Julie!

| am attaching the schedule for HELP this summer. | have you scheduled the same day and time as in the past.
If you will be needing hotel accommodations, please let me know and | will make those arrangements at the
Doubletree Suites at Southcenter.

Thank you again for your willingness to present. It is greatly appreciated. | will be sending additional reminders
as we get closer to the date, along with a reimbursement form for mileage and the stipend for presenting.



Jane Rausch

HELP Coordinator

email: "julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu Julie Mondry"Tuesday, April 3, 2018 at 2:43:21 PM Pacific Daylight Time
To: email: "jrausch@wspa.net jrausch@wspa.net"

Hi Jane,

Thanks for the email and update! | will use my same presentation as last year and make any necessary
changes. | will keep in touch :)

Thanks again and have a great week!
Julie

On Tue, Apr 3, 2018 at 2:23 PM, jrausch@wspa.net <jrausch@wspa.net> wrote:

Hi Julie!
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| am attaching the schedule for HELP this summer. | have you scheduled the same day and time as in the
past. If you will be needing hotel accommodations, please let me know and | will make those arrangements
at the Doubletree Suites at Southcenter.

Thank you again for your willingness to present. It is greatly appreciated. | will be sending additional
reminders as we get closer to the date, along with a reimbursement form for mileage and the stipend for
presenting.

Jane Rausch

HELP Coordinator



Julie Mondry
Payroll Officer
360-802-7118

email: "julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu Julie Mondry" Friday, April 13, 2018 at 9:17:19 AM Pacific Daylight Time
To: email: "jrausch@wspa.net jrausch@wspa.net”

Good morning,

| just receive this email from Linda at Clover Park:

Linda:

Julie committed to presenting at HELP on Budget, and said she may bring her replacement with her to take over in
the following years. When | sent the email regarding the schedule to Julie, it bounced back and said to reach out
to you. Would you mind forwarding her the email you received so that | can get a confirmation from her?

Thank you so much.

Jane Rausch
HELP Coordinator

| have the benefits portion and do not have a replacement? | sent a reply back to you on April 3rd with
my confirmation - (see below) - did you not receive it?
Please let me know as | thought we were good to go?

Thanks,
Julie

On Tue, Apr 3, 2018 at 2:23 PM, jrausch@wspa.net <jrausch@wspa.net> wrote:
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Hi Julie!

| am attaching the schedule for HELP this summer. | have you scheduled the same day and time as in the
past. If you will be needing hotel accommodations, please let me know and | will make those arrangements
at the Doubletree Suites at Southcenter.

Thank you again for your willingness to present. It is greatly appreciated. | will be sending additional
reminders as we get closer to the date, along with a reimbursement form for mileage and the stipend for
presenting.

Jane Rausch

HELP Coordinator



Julie Mondry
Payroll Officer
360-802-7118

email: "jrausch@wspa.net jrausch@wspa.net” Friday, April 13, 2018 at 11:31:05 AM Pacific Daylight Time
To: email: "julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu Julie Mondry"

I’'m good! | was confused... I'm all good now. Thank you for following up!

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Julie Mondry <julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu>

Sent: Friday, April 13,2018 9:17:19 AM

To: jrausch@wspa.net

Subject: Re: Summer HELP Program


https://aka.ms/o0ukef
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Good morning,

| just receive this email from Linda at Clover Park:

Linda:

Julie committed to presenting at HELP on Budget, and said she may bring her replacement with her to take over in
the following years. When | sent the email regarding the schedule to Julie, it bounced back and said to reach out
to you. Would you mind forwarding her the email you received so that | can get a confirmation from her?

Thank you so much.

Jane Rausch

HELP Coordinator

| have the benefits portion and do not have a replacement? | sent a reply back to you on April 3rd with
my confirmation - (see below) - did you not receive it?

Please let me know as | thought we were good to go?

Thanks,

Julie

On Tue, Apr 3, 2018 at 2:23 PM,
jrausch@wspa.net <jrausch@wspa.net> wrote:

Hi Julie!
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| am attaching the schedule for HELP this summer. | have you scheduled the same day and time as in the
past. If you will be needing hotel accommodations, please let me know and | will make those arrangements
at the Doubletree Suites at Southcenter.

Thank you again for your willingness to present. It is greatly appreciated. | will be sending additional
reminders as we get closer to the date, along with a reimbursement form for mileage and the stipend for
presenting.

Jane Rausch

HELP Coordinator



Julie Mondry
Payroll Officer

360-802-7118

email: "julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu Julie Wednesday, May 16, 2018 at 11:08:41 AM Pacific Daylight Time
Mondry"

To: email: "jumon2@live.com”

Cc: email: "juliem.payroll@gmail.com"

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: jrausch@wspa.net <jrausch@wspa.net>

Date: Fri, Apr 13, 2018 at 11:31 AM

Subject: Re: Summer HELP Program

To: Julie Mondry <julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu>

I’'m good! | was confused... I'm all good now. Thank you for following up!

Get Outlook for iOS
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From: Julie Mondry <julie_mondry@enumclaw.wednet.edu>
Sent: Friday, April 13, 2018 9:17:19 AM

To: jrausch@wspa.net

Subject: Re: Summer HELP Program

Good morning,

| just receive this email from Linda at Clover Park:

Linda:

Julie committed to presenting at HELP on Budget, and said she may bring her replacement with her to take over in
the following years. When | sent the email regarding the schedule to Julie, it bounced back and said to reach out
to you. Would you mind forwarding her the email you received so that | can get a confirmation from her?

Thank you so much.

Jane Rausch

HELP Coordinator

| have the benefits portion and do not have a replacement? | sent a reply back to you on April 3rd with
my confirmation - (see below) - did you not receive it?

Please let me know as | thought we were good to go?

Thanks,

Julie
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On Tue, Apr 3, 2018 at 2:23 PM,
jrausch@wspa.net <jrausch@wspa.net> wrote:

Hi Julie!

| am attaching the schedule for HELP this summer. | have you scheduled the same day and time as in the
past. If you will be needing hotel accommodations, please let me know and | will make those arrangements
at the Doubletree Suites at Southcenter.

Thank you again for your willingness to present. It is greatly appreciated. | will be sending additional
reminders as we get closer to the date, along with a reimbursement form for mileage and the stipend for
presenting.

Jane Rausch

HELP Coordinator
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